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Editors-in-Chief 

Silvia Gabrielli is a senior researcher in the Ubiquitous Interaction group at the 
CREATE-NET Research Consortium, Trento (Italy), which she joined in 2010. Since 
2008 she is also adjunct Professor of Human-Computer Interaction at the University 
of Trento (Faculty of Cognitive Sciences) within the Interfaces and Communication 
Technologies BSc Program. Over the last ten years she has been research scientist 
at FBK-IRST (Trento), HCI-Lab University of Udine, DIS University of Rome La 
Sapienza, Interaction Design Institute Ivrea (Torino) and Interact Lab (University of 
Sussex, Brighton, UK). She received her Ph.D. in Cognitive Sciences and a Master 
degree in Psychology from the University of Padova (I) in 2001 and 1994 
respectively. Her research interests include the human-centred design of Smart 
Environments and Interfaces for Personal Healthcare, Assisted Living and 
Edutainment. 

Tiziana Catarci got her Ph.D. in Computer Engineering in 1992 from the University 
of Roma “La Sapienza”, Italy. From 1987 to 1990, from 1990 to 1998, and from 1998 
to 2000 she was research assistant, assistant professor and associate professor 
respectively at the University of Roma “La Sapienza”, where she is now a full 
professor. Her main research interests are in theoretical and application oriented 
aspects of visual formalisms for databases, information visualization, database 
design, cooperative information systems, user interfaces, usability, digital libraries, 
data quality and Web access. On these topics she has published over 150 papers in 
leading journals and conferences and 20 books. Her contribution can be regarded as 
one of the first and most significant examples of deep analysis and formalization of 
the interaction between the user and the database, which takes in consideration both 
usability issues and language related aspects. 

With respect to applications, she has led or participated in various projects on visual 
query systems, usability studies and developed methodologies for database design. 
Particularly relevant are some European projects, including KIM, VENUS, FADIVA, 
LAURIN, SEWASIE,DELOS, Interop, WORKPAD, SM4All, aiming at investigating 
different aspects of interface design and human-computer interaction. Outside of 
academia, she has been a consultant to large (private and government) 
organisations. Since January 2009, she is delegate provost for ICT at “La Sapienza”. 
Dr. Catarci is regularly in the programming committees of the main database and 
human-computer interaction conferences and is associate editor of ACM SIGMOD 
Digital Symposium Collection (DiSC), VLDB Journal, World Wide Web Journal, and 
Journal of data Semantics. She has been associate editor of IEEE MULTIMEDIA for 
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several years. She has been the PC Co-chair of WISE 2003 and of ODBASE 2004, 
the Workshop co-chair of Interact 2005, and the tutorial co-chair of VLDB 2006. In 
2008, she has been the Note Co-chair of the 2008 edition of the largest and most 
important conference on human-computer interaction, ACM CHI. In 2009 she is one 
of the Track Chairs of ICDE 2009. She has been the organizing chair of the 27th 
International Conference on Very Large Databases (VLDB2001), has been the 
program co-chair of the Fifth IFIP Working Conference on Visual Database Systems 
(VDB5) and has been the program co-chair of the International Workshop on 
Advanced Visual Interfaces (AVI) in 1996 and is in the AVI steering committee. AVI is 
bringing together researchers in Human Computer Interaction and Databases since 
1992. She has been guest co-editor of two special issues of the Journal of Visual 
Languages and Computing (on “Visual Query Languages”), of ACM SIGMOD Record 
(on “Information Visualization”), of Information Systems (on “Data quality” and on 
“Data and Service Integration”), of the WWWJ (on “Multi-channel Adaptive 
Information Systems on the World Wide Web”) and of the VLDB Journal (on 
“Metadata Management”). 

Special Issues Editors 

Claudio E. Palazzi received the M.S. degree in computer science from University of 
California at Los Angeles (UCLA), Los Angeles, CA, USA, in 2005; the Ph.D. degree 
in computer science from University of Bologna (UniBO), Bologna, Italy, in 2006; and 
the Ph.D. degree in computer science from UCLA, in 2007. He was an Assistant 
Professor with the Department of Mathematics, University of Padua, Padua, 
Italy, from 2007 to 2010. He is currently an Associate Professor with the Department 
of Mathematics, University of Padua. He is active in various technical program 
committees in prominent international conferences and has co-authored over 120 
papers in international conference proceedings, books, and journals in his research 
topics. His research interests include protocol design and analysis for wired/wireless 
networks, with an emphasis on network-centric multimedia entertainment and 
vehicular networks. 

Pietro Manzoni received the MS degree in computer science from the “Università 
degli Studi” of Milan, Italy, in 1989, and the PhD degree in computer science from the 
“Politecnico di Milano”, Italy, in 1995. He is currently a full professor of computer 
science at the “Universitat Politècnica de València”, Spain in the Department of 
Computer Engineering. His research activity is related to mobile wireless data 
systems design, modelling, and implementation, particularly oriented to Intelligent 
Transport Systems and Smart Cities. He published more than 300 scientific papers, 
80 of them in international journals with impact; his H-index is 30 according to Google 
Scholar.  He has been actively involved in the organization or in the technical 
committee of various scientific conference and journals. He collaborates with various 
international academic and industrial research centres. He is a member of the IEEE. 

Ombretta Gaggi received the M.S. degree cum laude in Computer Science in 
December 1998 from University Ca’ Foscari of Venice. In 2003, she received her 
PHD in Computer Science from the Consortium of Universities of Bologna, Padova 
and Venice. From April 2003 to March 2006 she was a Post-doc fellow at the 
Department of Computer Science of Ca' Foscari University in Venice. 



Ombretta Gaggi is currently an Assistant Professor at the University of Padova. Her 
researcher interests include serious games, multimedia document and application 
design, web technologies and cross-platform development of mobile applications. 
She is serving as reviewer and program committee member in international 
conferences. 
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Oscar Mayora 
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Juan Carlos Augusto 
Middlesex University at London, UK 
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Silvia Mirri 
Università degli Studi di Bologna 

Ambient System's Performance Evaluation and Models 

Andrea Marin 
Università Ca' Foscari, Venezia 
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Armir Bujari 
Università degli Studi di Padova 

 


